
   

 

 

 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION RESPONSE 

FOI 3426 

Medical vacancies 

1.      How many permanent positions for doctors did the trust undertake recruitment to fill in 

2015? 38.4 WTE 

2.      What was the trust’s total spend on recruiting doctors in 2015? £165,958.30 

3.      What was the average length of time taken to fill vacant doctor posts in 2015? 93 days 

– the length of time from the advert being placed to when the doctor commenced in post 

4.      What was the trust’s total spend on employing locum doctors in 2015?  £22,090,254 Jan 

2015 – Dec 2015 

5.      What was the trust’s total spend on employing locum doctors to cover unfilled 

permanent posts in 2015? Information not recorded by the Trust in an accessible format. 

6.      What was the trust’s total spend on locum agency fees, for the recruitment of doctors, 

in 2015? Information not recorded by the Trust in an accessible format 

 


