



## FREEDOM OF INFORMATION RESPONSE

FOI 3473

**Restraining patients** 

1. How many patients have been physically restrained by hospital security staff 38 in 2015

a. Please list a breakdown of the reasons why Aggression, spitting and kicking staff

2. How many patients with a learning disability have been physically restrained by hospital security staff 0

a. Please list a breakdown of the reasons why

3. How many times have the police been called because of the behaviour of a patient 5 in 2014/15

a. Please list a breakdown of the reasons why We do not record this information so are unable to provide it to you.

b. Please outline what action was taken by the police We do not record this information so are unable to provide it to you.

4. How many times have the police been called because of the behaviour of a patient with a learning disability Our records show zero.

- a. Please list a breakdown of the reasons why
- b. Please outline what action was taken by the police