



FREEDOM OF INFORMATION RESPONSE

FOI 3127

Barrett's Oesophagus

- 1. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus (Specify time period) Information not recorded on cancer database
- a. Of those diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus, the number with high grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database
- b. Of those diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus, the number with low grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database
- 2. No. of patients under surveillance with Barrett's oesophagus Information not recorded on cancer database
- a. Of those under surveillance, the number with high grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database
- b. Of those under surveillance, the number with low grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database
- 3. No. of patients diagnosed with oesophageal adenocarcinoma

2011-2012: 40

2012-2013: 46

2013-2014: 59

- 4. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus who had an endoscopic mucosal resection (EMR)
- a. Of those who had EMR, the number for low grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database
- b. Of those who had EMR, the number for high grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database





c. Of those who had EMR, the number for intramucosal cancer Information not recorded on cancer database

- 5. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus who had radiofrequency ablation (RFA) without EMR
- a. Of those who had RFA, the number for low grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database
- b. Of those who had RFA, the number for high grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database
- c. Of those who had RFA, the number for intramucosal cancer Information not recorded on cancer database
- 6. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus who had EMR followed by radiofrequency ablation (RFA)
- a. Of those who had RFA, the number for low grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database
- b. Of those who had RFA, the number for high grade dysplasia Information not recorded on cancer database
- c. Of those who had RFA, the number for intramucosal cancer Information not recorded on cancer database
- 7. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus treated with photodynamic therapy Information not recorded on cancer database
- 8. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus treated with cryotherapy Information not recorded on cancer database





9. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus who had an antireflux operation Information not recorded on cancer database

10. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus who had an Oesophagectomy Information not recorded on cancer database

11. Total no. of patients treated for oesophageal cancer

a. Adenocarcinoma 2011-12: 40 2012-2013: 46 2013-2014: 59

b. Squamous cell carcinoma 2011-12: 15 2012-2013: 18 2013-2014: 11

c. Other cancer types 2011-12: 2 2012-2013: 1 2013-2014: 6

- 12. Total no. of patients treated for oesophageal cancer who had previously been diagnosed with Barrett's oeosophagus Information not recorded on cancer database
- 13. No. of patients with high grade dysplasia put back into surveillance without any other treatment Information not recorded on cancer database
- 14. Number of patients with HGD in surveillance who developed adenocarcinoma Information not recorded on cancer database
- 15. No. of people with adenocarcinoma treated with endoscopic therapies Information not recorded on cancer database
- 16. No. of people with stage T1A are treated with a) endoscopic therapies b) resection c) other treatments: Treated at tertiary centre
- 17. No. of people with stage T1B are treated with a) endoscopic therapies b) resection c) other treatments Treated at tertiary centre

Patients | Respect | Improve and innovate | Dependable | Empower





18. How many people with stage T2 are treated with a) endoscopic therapies b) resection c) other treatments Treated at tertiary centre